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 Legal Awareness Camp on Farmers’ Rights in Karimnagar District 
 

 
 

The Legal Aid Society of ICFAI Law School at IFHE, Hyderabad, organized a legal awareness 
camp on Farmers' Rights in collaboration with the District Legal Services Authority of 
Karimnagar on February 1, 2025, in Gattuboothkur Village, Gangadhara Mandal, Karimnagar.  

 

The initial meeting was held with Sri K. Venkatesh, Secretary of the District Legal Services 
Authority, Karimnagar District 



14 
 

 

Prof. Y. Pratap Reddy, Dean of ICFAI Law School, welcomed the guests, legal aid counsels, 
and farmers. He explained the camp's purpose, emphasizing the importance of awareness 
regarding one's rights and responsibilities. The Chief Guest, Shri B. Prathima, Principal District 
and Sessions Judge of Karimnagar, spoke to the farmers about various legislations designed to 
help improve their socio-economic conditions. She addressed the critical issue of farmer 
suicides, highlighting the importance of mental health support, financial security, and 
government intervention in preventing such tragedies. 

The Guest of Honor, Sri K. Venkatesh, Secretary of the District Legal Services Authority, 
Karimnagar, discussed essential laws such as the Bhu Bharathi Act, the Bhu Aadhar Number, 
and the Easements Act. He also warned about the rising incidents of cyber fraud targeting rural 
communities, urging farmers to be cautious of financial scams and to verify sources before 
engaging in online transactions. 

Judges from the Karimnagar District Court also attended, including Smt. P. Sarala Rekha, 3rd 
AJCJ cum Spl. JMFC for trial cases; Ms. Damarla Preethi, I Additional Junior Civil Judge cum 
I Additional Judicial Magistrate of First Class (Juvenile Court); and Sri D. Venkatesh, I Addl. 
District and Sessions Judge cum (in-charge) Spl. Sessions Judge for FTC for POCSO cases. 
They spoke about the rights of women laborers, insurance, and child protection. 

Special invitees, including Sri Ch. V.S. Janadhana Rao, District Education Officer, 
Karimnagar; K. Maheswar, RDO, Karimnagar; and Sri B. Ramanarao, Chairman of Bhagavathi 
Group of Schools, also attended the legal awareness camp and interacted with farmers. 

Legal Aid members presented posters illustrating farmers' rights under various laws, including 
the Protection of Plant Varieties and Farmers' Rights Act (PPV FRA) of 2001, the Rythu 
Bheema, and the Bandhu scheme. They highlighted the toll-free number (1800-200-1001) for 
farmers to register grievances. 

 
To engage the audience, the Legal Aid members performed a drama portraying two farmers 
struggling with drought, debt, and personal hardships. The characters inspired the farmers to 
adopt better agricultural practices through education and technology, delivering a message of 
hope that encouraged farmers to seek solutions rather than succumb to despair. 
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Prof. Pratap Reddy presented mementos to all the judges and special invitees who attended the 
event. Dr. K.V. Ravikumar delivered the vote of thanks. The Legal Awareness Camp at 
Karimnagar proved to be an enlightening session for farmers and community members, 
equipping them with essential legal knowledge. The discussions covered various topics, 
including farmers' economic rights, women's empowerment, child protection, cyber security, 
insurance policies, and land laws.  

 
The event concluded with an interactive session where farmers and attendees could seek legal 
clarifications from the esteemed panel. The Legal Aid Society of ICFAI Law School, 
Hyderabad, remains committed to conducting more awareness programs in the future, ensuring 
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that legal knowledge reaches the grassroots level and empowers individuals to exercise their 
rights effectively. The event covered in local news media.  
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